TABULATION OF BIDS

HANCOCK COUNTY UTILITY AUTHORITY

KILN REGIONAL WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS
PROJECT W5E - CDBG DISASTER RECOVERY - HANCUA 01
CONTRACT "B" - 500,000 GALLON ELEVATED WATER TANK

Qctober 28, 2008

CONTRACTORS BIDDING: Phoenix Fabricators and CB&lI Inc.
Erectors, Inc.
Certificate of Responsibility No.? 07521 05741
Acknowledgment of Addendum No. 1: YES YES
Acknowledgment of Addendum No. 2 YES YES
Bid Bond? YES YES
BASE BID
ITEM PLAN UNIT UNIT
NO. ITEM QUANTITY PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
1 MOBILIZATION 11L.S. $58,000.00 $58,000.00 No Bid $0.00
2 500,000 GALLON MULTI-LEG FLEVATED TANK 11L.8. $1,074,377.00! $1.074,377.00 No Bid $0.00
3 YARD PIPING AND ACCESSORIES 11L.8. $10,000.00 $10,000.00 No Bid $0.00
4 DISINFECT TANK AND COMPLY WITH BACTERIOLOGICAL STANDARDS 11L.8. $2,000.00 $2,000.00 No Bid $0.00
5 ELECTRICAL SYSTEM 1.L.S. $10,000.00 $10,000.00 No Bid $0.00
6 SITE WORK 1iL.8, $5,000.00 $5,000.00 No Bid $0.00
7 CHAIN LINK FENCE 1il.S. $18,000.00 $19,000.00 No Bid $0.00
8 CDBG PROJECT SIGN 11L.8, $100.00 $100.00 No Bid $0.00
TOTAL BASE BID $1,178,477.00 NO BID
ALTERNATE BID A
ITEM PLAN UNIT UNIT
NO. ITEM QUANTITY PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
1 MOBILIZATION - 1iL.8. $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00
2 500,000 GALLON SINGLE PEDESTAL ELEVATED TANK 11L.8. $1,192,784.00| $1,192,784.00] $1,181,000.00| $1,181,000.00
3 YARD PIPING AND ACCESSORIES 1]L.8. $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
4 DISINFECT TANK AND COMPLY WITH BACTERIOLOGICAL STANDARDS 11L.8. $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
5 ELECTRICAL SYSTEM : 111..S. $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
6 SITE WORK 1]L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,600.00 $20,000.00
7 CHAIN LINK FENCE 1|L.S. $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
8 CDBG PROJECT SIGN 1|L.S. $100.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE
AND CORRECT TABULATION OF BIDS.

P, Sooir s

M. Scott Burge, P.E.
Cert. No. 9550
October 28, 2008

$1,304,884.00

$1,314,000.00




